



Posted: 03/20/2013  
Amended: 03/21/2013

CANNON BUILDING  
861 SILVER LAKE BLVD., SUITE 203  
DOVER, DELAWARE 19904-2467

STATE OF DELAWARE  
DEPARTMENT OF STATE

TELEPHONE: (302) 744-4500  
FAX: (302) 739-2711  
WEBSITE: WWW.DPR.DELAWARE.GOV

DIVISION OF PROFESSIONAL REGULATION

<b>PUBLIC MEETING NOTICE:</b>	<b>BOARD OF DENTISTRY &amp; DENTAL HYGIENE</b>
<b>DATE AND TIME:</b>	<b>Thursday, March 21, 2013 at 3:00 p.m.</b>
<b>PLACE:</b>	861 Silver Lake Boulevard, Dover, Delaware <b>Conference Room A, Second Floor of the Cannon Building</b>

AMENDED AGENDA  
(Amended Items marked by \*)

- 1.0 Call to Order
- 2.0 Review and Approval of Meeting Minutes
  - 2.1 January 17, 2013
- 3.0 Executive Session
  - 3.1 Acceptance of Digital Radiography for the Dental/Dental Hygienist Exam
  - 3.2 Exam Recording Sheet- add teeth to be probed and area to record scores for dental charting, medical charting, periodontal charting
  - 3.3 **Informal Meeting with Exam Candidate- D6 2:45 PM**
  - 3.4 **Informal Meeting with Exam Candidate- D5 4:15 PM**
- 4.0 Unfinished Business
  - 4.1 Status of Dental Legislation
    - 5.1.1 Rules and Regulations Hearing in May
  - 4.2 Dental Anesthesia Advisory Consultant Compensation
  - 4.3 Dentistry and Dental Hygiene Audit\*
    - 5.3.1 Robert Blitzer\*
- 5.0 New Business
  - 5.1 Ratification of Licenses/Permits Issued by DPR since Last Board Meeting
    - 5.1.1 Dentists
      - 5.1.1.1 David Dieu
    - 5.1.2 Dental Hygienists
      - 5.1.2.1 Cynthia Codichini
      - 5.1.2.2 Georgia Ekonomou
      - 5.1.2.3 Amber Bloch
      - 5.1.2.4 Rebecca Durand\*
    - 5.1.3 Restricted Permit I – none

5.1.4 Restricted Permit II  
5.1.4.1 Rinku Parmar

5.1.5 Unrestricted Permit – none

5.2 Review of Applications for Licensure – none

5.3 Review Hearing Officer Recommendations – none

5.4 Westside Family Health Presentation on Transitional License Proposal

5.5 DSDS Request for Child Abuse/Neglect Mandatory CE

6.0 Complaints

6.1 New Complaint Assignments

09-23-12 Ms. Madden

09-24-12 Dr. Lenz

09-01-13 Dr. Director

09-02-13 Dr. Bunting

09-03-13 Dr. Lenz

09-04-13 Dr. McAneny

09-05-13 Dr. Jones

09-06-13 Dr. Jones\*

6.2 Dismissed by the Division of Professional Regulation

09-11-12\*

09-24-12

09-04-12

6.3 Dismissed by the Deputy Attorney General

09-06-10

09-15-11

7.0 Discipline & Compliance

7.1 Dr. Bruce Fay Letter

7.1.1 CE submitted\*

7.2 Dr. Tawana Medlin\*

7.3 Christina Harrison\*

8.0 Correspondence

8.1 Funding Request for Calibration Consultant

8.2 Dental Hygienists Letters

8.3 2013 National Dental Examiners' Advisory Forum (NDEAF)

9.0 Other Business before the Board (for discussion only)

10.0 Public Comment

10.1 Dr. Howard Zucker- CE credits from CCHS Dental Residency Program

11.0 Next Meeting- Thursday, May 16, 2013 at 3:00 pm in the **Second-Floor Conference Room A** of the Cannon Building

12.0 Adjournment

**Pursuant to 29 Delaware Code, Section 10004(e)(2), the Board shall pre-announce or pre-publish all Executive Sessions; however, such agenda shall be subject to change to include additional items including Executive Sessions which arise at the time of the body's meeting.**

**MEMBERS: PLEASE CALL THE OFFICE OF THE DELAWARE BOARD OF DENTISTRY & DENTAL HYGIENE AT 302-744-4500 OR EMAIL [customerservice.dpr@state.de.us](mailto:customerservice.dpr@state.de.us) IMMEDIATELY IF YOU CANNOT ATTEND THE MEETING. THANK YOU.**